

Chairman Alan Fossi on Wednesday, March 19, 2014 at 7:00pm in the Meeting Room of the Municipal Building, called the Regular Monthly Meeting of the Sewickley Township Board of Supervisors to order. The members of the Board of Supervisors present were Alan Fossi, Wanda Layman, and Joe Kerber. Also attending the meeting were Joe Marincic, Billy Dull, Joy DeClaudio, Marianne Errett, Tracy Hampshire, Ruth Lucov, Tom Lord, Sandy Dull, Amber Kline, Eric Kline, Steve Solomon, Maria Vanyo, Patty Vanyo, Dakota Cross, Nathan Cross, Haley Lauffer, Mary McDonald, Rebecca McDonald, Molly Higgins, Marla Lauffer, Karley Spudy, Marissa Lauffer, Dean Higgins, Kathy Kerber, Brian Merdian, Yvonne Merdian, Joe Napsha, Renell Palm, Maria Klim, Lane Palm, Alex Schork, Paula Alcott, Janet Schork, Dean Zimmerman, and Susan Leukhardt.

Mr. Fossi led those present in the Pledge of Allegiance.

Report from Township Coordinator, Wanda Layman

Working with Waste Management on their billing. Dollar Energy with residents. Spent time trying to get salt and anti-skid delivered which was done today. Talked with Mandy at Chevron regarding roads that need repaired from Atlas. Chevron is going to repair them and then get reimbursed from Atlas. Looking for a sweeper to rent. The cost of repairing ours is over \$20,000. Contacted City of Jeannette but they never called back. REM Hauling had a machine but it needed many repairs. A & H Equipment agreed to a six week rental for \$10,000. Met with the Township Engineer and EQT Seismic Testing. Sent the Land Bank contract to Dan Hewitt for him to look over along with the sweeper rental agreement. Contacted the insurance company for a certificate of insurance for the sweeper rental.

Public Works Report

Plowing and Salting.
Repaired rear seals on #10.
Fixed up little trailer for year.
Cleaned ditch on Bells Mill Rd and Pinewood Rd.
Fixed soft spots on Scott Haven Rd.
Fixed radiator on #3.
New Loader was delivered.
Fixed weight limit signs and stop signs that have been hit during the winter months.
Working to get #9 ready to do brushing and ready for the summer months.
Put d-ring on the front of the loader and also mounted the amber lights on the new loader.
Changed pipe Rodebaugh Rd, cleaned up at the bottom, and cut ditch line.
Lots of patching.
Working to get the Power Broom on the street.

Report from Ordinance Officer, Dean Zimmerman

Since my last report and the passage of the amendment to the Parking Ordinance, we had an improvement in the number of vehicles that hindered snow removal. There were a couple vehicles that I put notices on to have them moved and the owners complied with no problem so towing did not have to occur. I have had a few complaints about junk vehicles and property maintenance. Now that the snow has melted, Residents are able to see what their neighbor's property looks like and I am starting to get those calls. Of course now that spring officially begins tomorrow, I need to remind folks about burning on the correct days and times which are Saturdays and Wednesdays from 6:00am to 6:00pm. Additionally, the grass will be starting to grow soon and residents need to tune up those lawn mowers so they are ready to go when the time comes. One of the two Summary Trials that I had scheduled for March 3rd was rescheduled because the defendant was working out of town and that hearing is now scheduled for Friday, April 4th along with the two others that were already scheduled. At this time, I do not have any more new trials pending. I checked with the District Court today and one of the arrest warrants has been vacated leaving seven active. I was told that the man who had his warrant vacated showed up at the

Courthouse in Greensburg and was picked up on the warrant. He has entered a guilty plea and will be put on a payment plan. Unfortunately for him, he has not brought his property into compliance so will probably be back in front of the judge again.

Report from Recreation Director, Janet Schork

Paper/Litter Cleanup at Library

- Thank you to Boy Scout Troop 259 for cleaning up all the paper and litter that blew out of the paper recycling receptacles at library.
- We filled around 10 large garbage bags

Baseball Fields:

- Recreation Board voted to keep the Baseball/Football Field Rates and rules the same as last year for the 2014 season.

Pool:

- Once the weather warms a little, I will be meeting with our pool supplier, Lou Schmidt, to evaluate what maintenance needs to be performed before we can open.
- No pool membership or admission price changes this year. The only change is that we are now allowing free Wednesday Evening swim for all pool membership pass holders. General admission is \$3.00. The rates are on this month's agenda.

Recreation Center:

- February Recreation Center Dance was another success with approximately 100 children ages K-6th grade attending. Once again, the Recreation Board did a great job. The profit was approximately \$600.
- The final Wednesday Public Time will be ending this month on March 26th. I will have the final figures at next month's meeting.
- Upcoming Events:
 - Recreation Dance this month on Saturday, March 29th from 7:00pm to 9:30pm
 - Easter Egg Hunt is on Saturday, April 19th at noon at the baseball/football fields
 - Rabies Clinic at Crabapple Park Large Pavilion in May depending on the availability of Dr. Fondrk.

Public Comment

Mr. Fossi welcomed Troop 21086 and explained "Robert's Rules".

Joy DeClaudio asked Mrs. Layman if permits are required for seismic testing. Mrs. Layman stated that the roads need to be bonded for the thumper trucks. You really can't keep them out. ION is going on personal property only and they have to get permission from the property owners.

Ms. DeClaudio then asked when the ditches will be cleaned out on Brunazzi Road. Mrs. Layman stated that they are trying to get things done now that the snow is melted. Brian Nicholls will give her a call with the schedule.

Tom Lord asked what is going on with Falls Road. Mrs. Layman stated that we have been waiting for the permit from DEP and plus the snow hasn't let up.

Maria Vanyo from Girl Scout Troup 21086 spoke about having a new playground, basketball court, and tennis court at the Sewickley Ballfields. We need more exciting stuff for the older kids. Mr. Fossi stated that there are talks about curbing the tennis courts, filling them with water, and letting them freeze over in the winter for ice skating.

Tom Lord stated that Rillton and Hutchingson are part of the Township too and they need playgrounds also.

Alex Schork presented to the Board of Supervisors an Eagle Scout Project for Crabapple Park. This would include redoing the turnaround at the end of the park near the large pavilion, replacing the retaining wall, new landscaping, and a light on the flagpole.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to approve this Eagle Scout Project and paying for the materials involved. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to disburse 2013 EMS Tax funds on behalf of Lower Volunteer Fire Company as follows:

S & T Bank – mortgage payment	\$ 602.25
-------------------------------	-----------

Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to disburse 2013 EMS Tax funds on behalf of Herminie Volunteer Fire Company as follows:

Good Year – tires for engine (ratify)	\$ 1,686.26
Bickerstaff Repair Center – repairs to engine	\$ 580.00

Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to disburse 2013 EMS Tax funds on behalf of Rillton Volunteer Fire Company as follows:

Premier Safety & Service, Inc. – repairs to ladder truck	\$ 722.27
1 st State Bank – payment on ladder truck loan	\$ 10,000.00

Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Wanda Layman made a motion, seconded by Joe Kerber, to purchase two (2) single axle trucks and plows with central hydraulics through the Turnpike Auction for up to \$100,000.00. The main purpose of these trucks is for snow removal and will be purchased with Impact Fee money. Board Comments: Mrs. Layman stated that they are hoping to get them for \$30,000 to \$40,000. One of our trucks has a broken frame. Mr. Kerber asked if anyone looked into buying two new trucks like last time. He is concerned about buying from this auction again. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals for approximately 3,500 ton of Type 2 anti-skid materials were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Monday, March 17, 2014 at 10:00am as follows:

		Ligonier Stone & Lime Company d/b/a Derry Stone & Lime Company	
		FOB Plant Per Ton	Deliver to Twp Bldg Per Ton
3,500 ton	Type 2 Anti-Skid Material	\$ 13.80	\$ 21.28

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to award the proposal for approximately 3,500 ton of Type 2 Anti-Skid to Ligonier Stone & Lime Company at the above prices. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2014 to April 25, 2015. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals for the following were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Monday, March 17, 2014 at 10:00am as follows:

	Culverts, Inc.	Pleasant Unity Supply
	Deliver to Twp Bldg	Deliver to Twp Bldg
Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2' x 4' x 3'	\$ 250	\$ 252
Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2' x 4' x 2'	\$ 208	\$ 207
Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2' x 2' x 2'	\$ 161	\$ 162
Type "M" Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2' x 4' x 8"	\$ 369	\$ 365
Type "M" Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2' x 4' x 6"	\$ 369	No Bid
Type "M" Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2' x 2' x 8"	\$ 185	\$ 129
2' x 4' x 2" Inlet Riser	No Bid	No Bid
2' x 4' x 4" Inlet Riser	\$ 56	\$ 51
2' x 4' x 1" Inlet Riser	No Bid	No Bid
2' x 4' x 6" Inlet Riser	\$ 56	\$ 52
2' x 4' x 8" Inlet Riser	No Bid	No Bid
2' x 4' x 12" Inlet Riser	\$ 81	\$ 75

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to award the following items to Culverts, Inc.: Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2' x 4' x 3' ; Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2' x 2' x 2' ; and Type "M" Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2' x 4' x 6". The contract shall be effective April 26, 2014 to April 25, 2015. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to award the following items to Pleasant Unity Supply: Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2' x 4' x 2' ; Type "M" Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2' x 4' x 8" ; Type "M" Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2' x 2' x 8" ; 2' x 4' x 4" Inlet Riser ; 2' x 4' x 6" Inlet Riser ; and 2' x 4' x 12" Inlet Riser. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2014 to April 25, 2015. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals for the following were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Monday, March 17, 2014 at 10:00am as follows:

		Culverts, Inc.	Chemung Supply	Pleasant Unity Supply	PipeLines, Inc.	HD Supply Waterworks
	Deliver to Township Building Per Foot / Each					
100 feet	10 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections	\$ 4.27	\$ 3.65	\$ 4.27	\$ 4.27	\$ 4.49
200 feet	12 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections	\$ 4.73	\$ 4.45	\$ 4.73	\$ 4.73	\$ 4.98
600 feet	24 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections	\$ 14.45	\$ 13.35	\$ 14.45	\$ 14.45	\$ 14.90
100 feet	36 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections	\$ 25.68	\$ 26.00	\$ 25.68	\$ 25.68	\$ 27.00
600 feet	4 inch Schedule 40 plastic pipe, 10 foot sections	\$ 1.80	No Bid	\$ 2.39	call for current pricing	No Bid
200 feet	6 inch Schedule 40 plastic pipe, 10 foot sections	\$ 3.90	No Bid	\$ 4.02	call for current pricing	No Bid
30 each	4 inch Fernco plastic to plastic	\$ 4.00	No Bid	\$ 4.02	\$ 5.37	\$ 6.92
30 each	4 inch Fernco clay to plastic	\$ 4.00	No Bid	\$ 4.02	\$ 5.37	\$ 6.92
120 feet	60 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections Must be PennDot Approved	\$ 82.40	\$ 77.20	\$ 82.40	\$ 82.40	\$ 84.95

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to award the following items to Culverts, Inc.: 36 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections ; 4 inch Schedule 40 plastic pipe, 10 foot sections ; 6 inch Schedule 40 plastic pipe, 10 foot sections ; 4 inch Fernco plastic to plastic ; and 4 inch Fernco clay to plastic. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2014 to April 25, 2015. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to award the following items to Chemung Supply: 10 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections ; 12 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections ; 24 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections ; and 60 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2014 to April 25, 2015. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals for the following were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Monday, March 17, 2014 at 10:00am as follows:

		Hanson Aggregates	Amerikohl Aggregates, Inc.
		Deliver to Twp Bldg	Deliver to Twp Bldg
2,500 ton	2A	\$ 15.43	\$ 16.46
1,000 ton	2RC	\$ 15.43	\$ 16.46
500 ton	#8 Aggregate	\$ 25.43	\$ 30.46
800 ton	#3 Aggregate	\$ 17.43	\$ 18.81
500 ton	#1 Aggregate	\$ 14.43	\$ 15.26
500 ton	Gabion Stone	\$ 18.93	\$ 20.31
2,500 ton	#57 Limestone	\$ 17.43	\$ 19.66
2,500 ton	#67 Limestone	\$ 18.43	\$ 20.51
500 ton	R-4	\$ 18.93	\$ 21.21
500 ton	#4 Aggregate	\$ 17.43	\$ 19.71

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to award the 2014 Stone Bid to Hanson Aggregates. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2014 to April 25, 2015. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals for the following were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Monday, March 17, 2014 at 10:00am as follows:

		Suit Kote Corp	Russell Standard Corp	Midland Asphalt
		Delivered As Directed	Delivered As Directed	Delivered As Directed
5,000 gallon	AE – T (Tack Oil) Delivered	\$ 1.609	\$ 1.286	No Bid
5,000 gallon	AE – T (Tack Oil) Applied to Road	\$ 1.609	\$ 5.45	No Bid
50,000 gallon	CRS-2	\$ 2.299	\$ 2.222	\$ 2.41
4,000 gallon	E-1 Prime	\$ 1.611	\$ 1.776	\$ 1.83

Note: Russell Standard Corporation did not supply a Non Collusion Affidavit with their sealed bid.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman to award the 2014 Liquid Bituminous Bid to Suit Kote Corporation. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2014 to April 25, 2015. Board Comments: Mrs. Layman received prices from Midland through CoStars. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals for the following were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Monday, March 17, 2014 at 10:00am as follows:

		Hanson Aggregates
		FOB Plant
6,000 ton	Superpave Asphalt 9.5 mm, PG 64-22 0 to 0.3 million ESAL's SRL-G	\$ 59.00 / ton
6,000 ton	Superpave Asphalt 9.5 mm, PG 64-22 0.3 to 3 million ESAL's SRL-G	\$ 59.00 / ton
6,000 ton	Superpave Asphalt 19.0 mm, PG 64-22 0 to 0.3 million ESAL's SRL-G	\$ 53.00 / ton
6,000 ton	Superpave Asphalt 19.0 mm, PG 64-22 0.3 to 3 million ESAL's SRL-G	\$ 53.00 / ton

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to award the Superpave Contract to Hanson Aggregates at the above prices. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2014 to April 25, 2015. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to purchase Bituminous Stockpile Patching material (cold mix) through Hei-Way, LLC which is also through the COSTARS Program. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Monday, March 17, 2014 at 11:00am for "Township Mowing". They are as follows:

"TOWNSHIP MOWING" Includes the following locations	Welch's Yardman	5 Star Landscaping
a) Township Building lawn b) Recreation Center lawn c) Recreation Center bank facing Pike Street d) The former Herminie Reservoir property located on Highland Avenue e) Guffey Cemetery f) Quaker Cemetery g) Shaner Honor Roll h) The Project 70 property located at the Sewickley Township Volunteer Fire Company No. 3 (Rillton) i) Keystone Playground j) Reservoir Road Cemetery k) ** Lowber Playground (inside and outside of fence) l) ** Township Property located at corner of Pike Street and Elk Street, Herminie m) ** 24 Highland Avenue, Herminie n) ** Township Property located on Cameron Avenue, Hutchinson ** changes / additions from previous years Township Mowing	\$ 628.00	\$ 700.00

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to award the "Township Mowing" contract for the locations listed above to Welch's Yardman. This includes the cutting and trimming of those locations when the height of the grass reaches four inches. The Contractor shall be responsible for labor, fuel, materials, equipment costs, and Workers Compensation and Liability Insurance. The contract shall be effective March 20, 2014. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Monday, March 17, 2014 at 11:00am for "Crabapple Mowing". They are as follows:

"CRABAPPLE MOWING" Includes the following locations	Loren Fox	5 Star Landscaping	Russell Shank
John C. Bruno Memorial Football Field All baseball and softball fields Crabapple Park	\$ 495.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 800.00

Note: Russell Shank did not supply a Non Collusion Affidavit with his sealed bid.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to award the "Crabapple Mowing" contract for the locations listed above to Loren Fox. This includes the cutting and trimming of those locations when the height of the grass reaches three inches. The Contractor shall be responsible for labor, fuel, materials, equipment costs and Workers Compensation and Liability Insurance. The contract shall be effective March 20, 2014. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to approve the Vay subdivision located at the intersection of Mars Hill Road and Dick Station Road. This plan divides Lot 1 containing 1.0 acre from the residual Parcel A containing 16.798 acres. Lot 1 contains an existing dwelling that has public water, electric, and an on-lot septic system. The zoning is A-1 and parcel A is designated as non-buildable. This plan has been approved by the Planning Commission. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to approve the Feltes Family Trust Plan #6 subdivision. This plan divides 5.03 acres located on Oggs Lane from the residual 34 acres owned by the Feltes Family Trust. This parcel is added as a side/rear lot addition to the Ken Kasunic property located on Sulphur Springs Road. The property is zoned A-1 and the parcel is agricultural non-buildable. This plan has been approved by the Planning Commission. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to accept the 2013 Municipal Annual Audit and Financial Report for the Township of Sewickley. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to ratify a rental agreement with A & H Equipment for the rental of a sweeper truck for a six week period of time. The cost is \$10,000.00. Comments: Tom Lord asked what it would cost to have it contracted out with an hourly rate. Mrs. Layman stated it was \$100 per hour. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to enter into an agreement with the Westmoreland County Conservation District to conserve the natural resources of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania within this Municipality. Board Comments: Mr. Fossi stated that this is an agreement of cooperation. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to enter into the Westmoreland County Land Bank Agreement for a fee of \$5,000.00. Board Comments: Mr. Fossi explained that this allows the County to purchase tax delinquent properties, clean it up, and remove all liens against it. They can then sell the property to a new owner which will then generate taxes again. The School District has to approve this also for it to work. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to establish the 2014 daily and seasonal admission rates for Crabapple Pool. Please see attached. There is no increase from last year. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to advertise for summer employment at Crabapple Pool. Positions include lifeguards, concession, and managers. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to offer Crabapple Pool Buy One Get One Admission Passes to enrollees of the Adams Pledge. Board Comments: Mr. Fossi explained that Adams Pledge is for Middle and High School students that pledge to be against drug use. These students volunteer to take drug tests. Businesses in the Community are offering discounts to these students. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to authorize the Herminie Boy Scout Troup 259 use of the large pavilion at Crabapple Park at no cost each Thursday evening from June 5, 2014 through September 4, 2014. In lieu of payment for facility use, the Boy Scouts will be assisting Park Maintenance perform Lake and Park cleanup on a date to be determined. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to authorize the following 2014 rental rates for Bruno Field and Baseball Fields. Rates do not apply to Sewickley Township youth sports teams. There is no increase from the previous year.

Baseball Fields: \$15 per hour per field with a 3 hour minimum rental

Bruno Field: \$100 per hour with a 4 hour minimum rental
Rental excludes use of concession stand

Rules: Proof of Insurance mandatory.
Schedule of fields and times presented to the Recreation Director prior to renting fields.
All teams (Sewickley & non-Township) are responsible for disposing of garbage to dumpsters.
All teams (Sewickley & non-Township) are responsible for clearing dugouts, fields, and spectator areas of garbage after each game.
No smoking is permitted inside the Herminie Sports Complex.
No Pets of any kind are allowed inside the Herminie Sports Complex.

Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman to deny Narcotics Anonymous request to use the Sewickley Township Recreation Center for their weekly meetings at no cost. Board Comments: The meeting room at the Recreation Center is not large enough and the gym is rented on Sunday nights. Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Wanda Layman made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to allow Herminie VFC to relocate their new fire siren from the Recreation Center Building to new site location on Township Property. Board Comments: Mr. Kerber asked why are we taking this off the Recreation Center. Eric Kline, Herminie Fire Chief, explained that the current system is practically obsolete and to repair it would cost as much to get a new one. Also, the County is changing the system that will make their siren useless. Herminie has received a grant for over \$15,000 to make this change. Using the Recreation Center has also become an issue with having it located inside the building. Tracy Hampshire asked what other locations have been looked at other than beside her house. Mr. Kline responded that the only other option would be to make a modification to the roof of the Recreation Center. He really has explored all options. Mrs. Hampshire feels this will be located so close to their homes. She supports the fire department, but lowering it and moving it closer to the homes is not fair due to the noise level. Further conversations took place between several groups of people. Voting: Mr. Fossi, yes; Mrs. Layman, yes; Mr. Kerber, no. Motion carried.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to approve the following bills for payment.

General Fund: Check 6087 - \$ 18,670.00 (2/27/14)
 Checks 6088 to 6134 - \$ 87,402.23 (3/3/14)
 Drafts 150090 to 150091 - \$ 1,429.32 (3/7/14)
 Checks 6135 to 6170 - \$ 46,321.72 (3/12/14)

Crabapple: Checks 4055 to 4057 - \$ 516.97 (3/3/14)
 Draft 53 - \$ 208.67 (3/7/14)
 Checks 4058 to 4060 - \$ 152.96 (3/12/14)

Light Districts: Draft 126 - \$ 2,598.92 (3/7/14)
 Draft 127 - \$ 467.54 (3/7/14)
 Draft 128 - \$ 526.95 (3/7/14)
 Draft 129 - \$ 204.92 (3/7/14)

Payroll Invoices: Checks 3330 to 3334 - \$ 3,573.21 (3/3/14)
 Draft 90194 - \$ 12,792.95 (3/7/14)
 Checks 3339 to 3340 - \$ 703.86 (3/12/14)
 Draft 90195 - \$ 740.86 (3/19/14)
 Draft 90196 - \$ 688.13 (3/19/14)

Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Wanda Layman, to approve the following payrolls for payment.

Employees Payroll: 2/28/14 - \$ 11,545.88 – checks 3328 to 3329 , drafts 23950 to 23963
 3/7/14 - \$ 11,717.57 – checks 3335 to 3336 , drafts 23964 to 23977
 3/14/14 - \$ 12,538.92 – checks 3337 to 3338 , drafts 23978 to 23992
 3/21/14 - \$ 11,620.75 – checks 3341 to 3344 , drafts 23993 to 24007

Voting: Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

New / Old Business

The Sewickley Township Board of Supervisors will continue holding public forums to discuss Local Police coverage within Sewickley Township. They are as follows: Tuesday, March 25th at 7:00pm at the Lowber Volunteer Fire Company and Thursday, March 27th at 7:00pm at the Hutchinson Volunteer Fire Company.

Mrs. Kerber stated that she appreciated the Supervisors consideration regarding paying her fee for the PSATS' Convention but she is no longer interested.

With no further business to come before the Board, Joe Kerber made a motion to adjourn, seconded by Wanda Layman. Voting: Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi, Mrs. Layman; yes. Meeting adjourned at 8:13pm.

Susan D. Leukhardt
Secretary-Treasurer

2014 CRABAPPLE POOL

Season Passes

Membership Type	Early Bird Resident Rate (ends May 31)	Early Bird Non-Resident Rate (ends May 31)	Resident Rate (begins June 1)	Non-Resident (begins June 1)
Family (2 adults + 3 children)	\$ 200	\$ 225	\$ 225	\$ 240
Family - Each Additional Child for family pass (max of 8 per pass)	\$ 20	\$ 25	\$ 25	\$ 30
Parent-Child	\$ 125	\$ 140	\$ 135	\$ 160
Individual	\$ 65	\$ 80	\$ 75	\$ 90
Senior (65+)	\$ 40	\$ 55	\$ 50	\$ 65
Senior Couple (65+)	\$ 65	\$ 80	\$ 75	\$ 90
10-Day Pass	\$ 35	\$ 40	\$ 50	\$ 55

Daily Admission Rates

General Admission (4 years old to adult)	\$ 6.00
3 and under	FREE
Non-Swimming Chaperone	FREE
Senior Citizens (65+)	\$ 3.00
After 5:00 pm	\$ 3.00
After 5:00 pm Seniors (65+)	\$ 2.00
Groups of 10 or more (must be pre-registered as group)	\$ 4.00
Wednesday Evening Swim (7:30pm to 10:00pm)	Pass Holders – FREE Non-Pass Holders / General Admission \$3.00