

Chairman Joseph Kerber on Wednesday, December 21, 2016 at 7:00pm in the Meeting Room of the Municipal Building called the Regular Meeting of the Sewickley Township Board of Supervisors to order as advertised in the Times-Sun on Thursday, December 31, 2015. The members of the Board of Supervisors present were Joseph Kerber, Brian Merdian, and Alan Fossi. Also attending the meeting were James Balog, Mark Petros, Jack McWilliams, Ann McWilliams, Linda Harvey, Jim Harvey, Sandy Dull, Chip Payne, Daniel Augustine, Wayne Jones, Lori Jones, George Lord, Paul McGinnis, Attorney Zachary Kansler, Debi Pils, Janet Schork, and Erika Horvat.

Mr. Kerber led those present in the Pledge of Allegiance.

An executive session was held on December 21, 2016 at 6:00pm to discuss personnel issues.

#### **Report from Roadmaster, Joe Kerber**

We replaced two forty ft. storm pipes on Shaner Road and replaced the guide rail also. We have been out the last seven days patching several roads here in the Township. I had the guys out putting up the Christmas lights in Herminie. We have been busy in the shop keeping all the equipment going for snow plowing and right now we have one truck down. We replaced some lighting at the Recreation building. Repaired a soft spot on Stewart Lane. The road crew was out eleven different times salting and plowing and hitting patchy spots after the storm. We used approximately 500 tons of salt and 300 tons of anti-skid so far this year. Slaughter Hollow Road is closed to replace storm pipes. We have one finished and three to go. With this weather it has been hard to get down there and get this finished up.

#### **Report from Ordinance Officer, Bill Hause, given by Supervisor Brian Merdian**

Since our last meeting, I have been handling the usual complaints of junk motor vehicles and garbage on various properties around the township. I have received numerous complaints on nuisance properties to which I have sent certified letters requiring them to bring the property in to compliance within thirty days. There have been a few complaints of dogs running at large. Hoffman's Kennels took care of the problem and the owners were notified. Residents and Business Owners are encouraged to clear snow from sidewalks in front of their properties. Drivers, please remember when parking to leave room for the snow plows during weather situations. Merry Christmas and Happy New Year.

Joe Kerber reminded the residents that if there are questions for the Ordinance Officer, we do have complaint forms here that can be filled out.

#### **Report from Recreation Director, Janet Schork**

##### **Recreation Center:**

- Everything running smoothly at the recreation center with most of the open time slots booked.
- Our Jump Start Volleyball program ended in November and the basketball program started on Saturday, December 3rd. We have 24 children participating.
- Open Gym, hosted by the recreation board, starts on Wednesday, January 4th from 4:30-5:30.
- Yoga/Fitness Room
  - Attendance has been steadily increasing for yoga and fitness classes offered in our new exercise room. The yoga/fitness studio is now in the old boy's locker room located on the first floor of the recreation center. The room has been cleaned of clutter and old equipment, as well as a fresh coat of paint on the walls & floor, and new lighting fixtures hung. At the beginning of January we will have heat and carpet installed. I will update the board next month on our progress.

- 7 Springs and Hidden Valley Ski Discount Tickets
  - New this winter, the recreation board is partnering with Pennsylvania Recreation & Park Society, Inc. to offer discounted lift tickets for 7-Springs and Hidden Valley ski resorts.
  - Once I receive the tickets, they will be available for purchase at the recreation center on Monday and Thursday between 11am-3pm.

**Crabapple Lake Park & Pool:**

- For the boards review, are park & pool rates for the 2017 season.
  - Due to the rise in operational costs, rates have been increased a little over 10% for daily admissions, day & evening parties.
  - Additionally, after a discussion with our pool manager, Yvonne Shawl, I'd like to recommend for the boards review, offering individual pool passes for the 2017 season. We believe this to be beneficial for both the patron and the pool while streamlining the season pass application process.
  - So that large families are not adversely affected, we've created a sliding scale so that as the number of household individuals rise, the cost per pass decreases.
  - Motion is Item #28 on the agenda. I'd be happy to answer any questions when item is open for public comment.
  - There will be NO increase in Swim Lesson or Crabapple Park Pavilion rentals.

**Township Winter Newsletter:**

- Work is ongoing for the newsletter
- I am still receiving advertising and articles.

A resident asked if this is just an informational newsletter. The Board of supervisors stated yes, there will be nothing political in the newsletter. Mrs. Schork stated it is not too late to get an ad in. Mr. Fossi stated that this newsletter is going into 2200 households.

**Public Comment**

Jim Balog lives on General Braddock Road and it seems we are back to day one. The problem I have been having with Krause Tree service is starting all over again. He was sent a letter by our ordinance officer to comply because he is in violation of ordinances in the Township. He temporarily moved all of his equipment to the back of the apartment and slowly he started to move everything back up front again. I tried to shovel snow off of my sidewalks today and I had to go back inside because I couldn't breathe because of the fumes from his trucks. To run a truck for an hour, two and three hours is a violation. Mr. Merdian stated that the Ordinance Officer is aware of the situation and he has sent out a new letter. Mr. Balog wanted to state again that this is a residential street and I want to keep it this way. All I want is a little respect. Just the other day he comes out to the end of the street and throws both arms up and the finger up on each hand. Attorney Kansler stated that if he doesn't comply we will look into the magistrate as the next step. Mr. Balog stated that there are always safety issues on this road.

Sandy Dull stated that Jim is a tax payer. Shouldn't he have more right that a renter. It's not fair to the tax payers that these renters come in and just run amuck and do whatever. Should the land lord be responsible? Attorney Kansler stated that he will look into the situation. Mrs. Dull stated that she has a similar situation and that why she is asking. Mr. Merdian stated that when Mitchell Gross was the Ordinance Officer he did per sue the landlord and Mr. Krause did seem to be complying at that time. Mrs. Dull also asked if we still get franchise fees from Comcast. On my bill it says that the fees are going to Armstrong County. Erika Horvat said we can pull the contract and look into this. We did make a phone call on this and nobody ever returned our call yet. Mrs. Harvey stated her bill is like this also and she is also waiting for a phone call back from Comcast. Attorney Kansler stated that he can help us look into this if he needs to.

Linda Harvey comment on the new kennel near Guffey. She is hoping that the dog catcher from Hoffman's will work with them. This is a no kill shelter.

Lori Jones questioned motion number 14. Does this fall under the Project 70 Act where all this money refers back to the park. Mr. Kerber stated yes, we are just renewing the lease. Mrs. Jones then asked, this money will then help us to renovate the park and the lake and maybe even put bathrooms in. The Supervisors answered that this is money for the park and pool. A resident stated that it cannot be used for the pool because it is a for profit organization.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to approve the minutes of the Sewickley Township Board of Supervisors Regular Meetings held on October 19, 2016 and November 16, 2016. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to disburse 2015 EMS Tax funds on behalf of Lowber Volunteer Fire Company as follows:

S & T Bank – mortgage payment	\$ 602.25
-------------------------------	-----------

Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

A resident asked if the Lowber Club is opened yet. If the Lowber Club opens up as a bar, why is our tax money paying their mortgage? Mr. Kerber stated that the Club just gave the fireman \$12,000.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to disburse 2015 EMS Tax funds on behalf of Herminie Volunteer Fire Company as follows:

WCCC – training	\$ 275.00
-----------------	-----------

Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to disburse 2015 EMS Tax funds on behalf of Sewickley Township Emergency Management as follows:

Walmart – 55" Smart HDTV, TV Wall Mount, Laser Printer	\$ 711.77
NEC – Two Projectors and Ceiling Mounts	\$ 2,440.68

The above listed items will be utilized to establish the Emergency Operations Center at its new location. These items will allow the team to simultaneously view weather, Knowledge-Center updates, and news feeds in an emergency situation in the Township.

MSATS – Office Space (1/1/17 to 12/31/17)	\$ 720.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>\$ 3,872.45</b>

Mr. Merdian wanted to state that with them moving over into the MSATS building, this is really some exciting work that they are doing with setting up this base of operations. This TV isn't here for them to just sit and watch TV. This is set up as a command post for when there is an emergency or crisis. They will be able to remotely video link to the site or problem and see live what is going on.

Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Brian Merdian to accept the quote from Gibson-Thomas Engineering in the amount of \$6,000.00. This is to prepare a Master Renovation Plan for the Crabapple Park & Bruno Field Complex. This cost excludes the plan for the pool. This will aid in the process of grant opportunities through DCED, DCNR, and other federal sources. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Lori Jones asked if that this could be paid out of the Project 70 money. Mr. Kerber stated that yes it possibly could.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Brian Merdian to adopt Resolution No. 48-2016 entering into a five year, no drill, oil and gas lease agreement with Chevron. This agreement gives Chevron exclusive rights to the oil and natural gas under Crabapple Park and Pool at \$1,500 per acre, 72.010 acres with a 15% royalty. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to renew Property and Casualty Coverage for all Sewickley Fire Companies with Varine- Slavin using Selective at the premiums below. Policy is effective from December 18, 2016 to December 18, 2017.

Herminie Fire Company:	\$ 11,442.00
Lowber Fire Company:	\$ 13,751.00
Rillton Fire Company:	\$ 11,677.00
Hutchinson Fire Company:	\$ 12,244.00

Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Monday, December 19, 2016 at 10:00am for Solid Waste Collection for the Township of Sewickley. They are as follows:

		Waste Management	Advanced Disposal Services
<b>Residential</b>	<b>2017</b>	<b>\$ 17.58</b>	<b>\$ 24.09</b>
<b>Per Unit</b>	<b>2018</b>	<b>\$ 18.11</b>	<b>\$ 24.09</b>
<b>Per Month</b>	<b>2019</b>	<b>\$ 18.65</b>	<b>\$ 24.09</b>
<b>Residential – Sr. Citizen</b>	<b>2017</b>	<b>\$ 15.82</b>	<b>\$ 21.68</b>
<b>Per Unit</b>	<b>2018</b>	<b>\$ 16.29</b>	<b>\$ 21.68</b>
<b>Per Month</b>	<b>2019</b>	<b>\$ 16.78</b>	<b>\$ 21.68</b>
<b>Sr. Citizen</b>	<b>2017</b>	<b>\$ 3.65</b>	<b>N/A</b>
<b>Per Garbage Bag</b>	<b>2018</b>	<b>\$ 3.80</b>	<b>N/A</b>
	<b>2019</b>	<b>\$ 3.95</b>	<b>N/A</b>
<b>Two-Yard Container</b>	<b>2017</b>	<b>\$ 40.15</b>	<b>No Bid / Late Bid - \$50.00</b>
	<b>2018</b>	<b>\$ 41.35</b>	<b>No Bid / Late Bid - \$50.00</b>
	<b>2019</b>	<b>\$ 42.59</b>	<b>No Bid / Late Bid - \$50.00</b>
<b>Four-Yard Container</b>	<b>2017</b>	<b>\$ 61.29</b>	<b>No Bid / Late Bid - \$80.00</b>
	<b>2018</b>	<b>\$ 63.13</b>	<b>No Bid / Late Bid - \$80.00</b>

	<b>2019</b>	<b>\$ 65.02</b>	<b>No Bid / Late Bid - \$80.00</b>
<b>Roll-Off, Six-Yard, and</b>	<b>2017</b>	<b>\$ 740.00 / mo</b>	<b>No Bid / Late Bid - \$186.70 per ton</b>
<b>Eight-Yard Containers</b>	<b>2018</b>	<b>\$ 765.00 / mo</b>	<b>No Bid / Late Bid - \$186.70 per ton</b>
<b>at fixed price per ton,</b>	<b>2019</b>	<b>\$ 785.00 / mo</b>	<b>No Bid / Late Bid - \$186.70 per ton</b>
<b>per collection.</b>			
<b>Including delivery and</b>			
<b>removal of box and</b>			
<b>disposal of waste for</b>			
<b>occasional or one-time</b>			
<b>customers</b>			

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to award the Solid Waste Garbage Removal Contract for the Township of Sewickley to Waste Management effective January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2019. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Brian Merdian to adopt Ordinance No. 6-2016 eliminating the assessment for the cost and expense of the maintenance of street lighting in the Herminie, Rillton, Lowber, and Sutersville Light Districts of the Township of Sewickley. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Joe Kerber to adopt Ordinance No. 7-2016 establishing the General Fund Budget for the Township of Sewickley for the fiscal year 2017. Mr. Fossi asked if this new budget would raise the millage 1.25 mills. Mr. Kerber and Mr. Merdian stated yes. Voting: Mr. Merdian, yes; Mr. Fossi, no; Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Joe Kerber to adopt Resolution No. 49-2016 establishing the real property tax rate for the fiscal year 2017. The Resolution is attached. Mr. Fossi asked for this to be explained to him. Attorney Kansler stated that the budget has to be adopted by way of an ordinance. According to the Second Class Township Code you need to state the specific tax rates by way of Resolution. Voting: Mr. Merdian, yes; Mr. Fossi, no; Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to approve a contract with Hoffman's Boarding Kennels through December 31, 2017 at the rate \$160.00 per month for twelve (12) months paid by the Township. Overtime calls will be charged at the rate of \$75.00 per call. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Brian Merdian to advertise the Reorganization Meeting for the Board of Supervisors to be held on Tuesday, January 3, 2017 at 7:00pm located at the Sewickley Township Municipal Building. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Brian Merdian to establish the regular monthly meeting location for the Sewickley Township Board of Supervisors at the Sewickley Township Municipal Building, 2288 Mars Hill Road, Irwin PA 15642. The dates on which the Board of Supervisors shall meet will be the third Wednesday of each month at 7:00pm and to advertise the same in the Tribune Review in accordance with the Sunshine Law. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to adopt Resolution No. 50-2016 appointing James Harvey to the Sewickley Township Zoning Board. This term shall expire the first Monday of January, 2021. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Brian Merdian to accept Brian Merdian's resignation from the Planning Commission effective December 31, 2016. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to accept John Goodrum's resignation from the Sutersville Sewickley Municipal Sewage Authority effective December 31, 2016. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to accept George Hebert's resignation from the Sutersville Sewickley Municipal Sewage Authority effective December 31, 2016. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Brian Merdian to ratify Janet Schork to work over her allotted hours on the payroll dates of December 9, and December 23, 2016. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Brian Merdian to set the Crabapple Park and Pool rates for 2017. Rates are listed on the last page of this agenda. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to close the Township Office on the following days during the Holiday season.

Monday, December 26, 2016  
Monday, January 2, 2017

Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Brian Merdian to approve the following bills for payment.

General Fund:	Checks 8274 to 8288 - \$ 37,978.15 (11/22/16)
	Checks 8290 to 8297 - \$ 2,176.56 (12/1/16)
	Checks 8298 to 8310 - \$ 16,328.40 (12/8/16)
	Checks 8311 to 8338 - \$ 10,943.05 (12/14/16)
Crabapple:	Checks 4413 to 4414 - \$ 171.58 (12/8/16)
	Check 4415 - \$ 35.48 (12/14/16)
Highway Aid:	Check 453 - \$ 4,767.12 (12/5/16)
	Check 454 - \$ 10,560.25 (12/27/16)
Payroll Invoices:	Check 4777 - \$ 32.40 (11/22/16)
	Checks 4779 to 4781 - \$ 2,401.82 (12/1/16)
	Checks 4784 to 4785 - \$ 375.77 (12/8/16)
	Check 4789 - \$ 32.40 (12/14/16)

Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to approve the following payrolls for payment.

Employees Payroll:

(twp) 11/25/16 - \$ 10,224.50  
(twp) 12/2/16 - \$ 9,061.88  
(twp) 12/9/16 - \$ 18,583.19  
(twp) 12/16/16 - \$ 13,613.33

Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

**New / Old Business**

Brian Merdian made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi to adopt an employee handbook and office policy for the Township of Sewickley. Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

**We would like to wish everyone a Happy, Healthy Holiday Season!**

With no further business to come before the Board, Brian Merdian made a motion to adjourn, seconded by Alan Fossi Voting: Mr. Merdian, Mr. Fossi, Mr. Kerber; yes. Motion carried unanimously. Meeting adjourned at 7:35pm.

Erika Horvat  
Secretary-Treasurer

**TOWNSHIP OF SEWICKLEY**  
**Westmoreland County, Pennsylvania**  
**Resolution No. 49-2016**

**A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWNSHIP OF SEWICKLEY, WESTMORELAND COUNTY,  
PENNSYLVANIA, FIXING THE TAX RATE FOR GENERAL TOWNSHIP PURPOSES  
AND OTHER PURPOSES FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING  
JANUARY 1, 2017, AND ENDING DECEMBER 31, 2017**

WHEREAS, pursuant to Pennsylvania Townships of the Second Class Code, 53 P.S. §68205, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Sewickley is authorized, by Resolution, to levy taxes upon all real property within the Township, made taxable for Township purposes; and,

WHEREAS, The Township of Sewickley desires to set the levies upon real property for the fiscal year beginning January 1, 2017, and ending December 31, 2017.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Sewickley, in regular meeting assembled and by authority of the same:

SECTION 1. That a tax be and the same is hereby levied and assessed upon on all real property within the Township of Sewickley subject to taxation for Township purposes for the fiscal year 2017 beginning January 1, 2017, and ending December 31, 2017, as follows:

A. GENERAL TOWNSHIP PURPOSES - a tax rate in the sum of 11.25 mills on each dollar of assessed valuation, at 100% market value of assessed valuation.

B. FIRE HYDRANTS AND FIRE HYDRANT WATER SERVICE - a tax rate in the sum of .25 mills on each dollar of assessed valuation, at 100% market value of assessed valuation levied in accordance with 53 P.S. §68205(a) (5), establish and maintain fire hydrants and fire hydrant water service in the Township.

C. TO LIGHT THE HIGHWAYS, ROADS AND OTHER PUBLIC PLACES IN THE TOWNSHIP - A tax rate in the sum of .75 mills on each dollar



of assessed valuation, at 100% market value of assessed valuation levied in accordance with 53 P.S. §68205(a)(2), to light the highways, roads and other public places in the Township.

D. AMBULANCE, RESCUE AND OTHER EMERGENCY SERVICES. A tax rate in the sum of 2 mills on each dollar of assessed valuation, at 100% market value of assessed valuation levied in accordance with 53 P.S. §68205(a)(8)(b), to support ambulance, rescue and other emergency services within the Township.

SECTION 3. The eleven and one-quarter (11.25) mill tax levy on each dollar of assessed valuations equals a rate of taxation of one dollar and twelve and one-half cents (\$1.125) on each one hundred dollar of assessed valuation of taxable property, the one-fourth (1/4 or .25) mill tax levy on each dollar of assessed valuations equals a rate of taxation of two and one-half cents (\$0.025) on each one hundred dollar of assessed valuation of taxable property, The three-quarter (3/4 or .75) mill tax levy on each dollar of assessed valuations equals a rate of taxation of seven and one-half cents (\$0.75) on each one hundred dollar of assessed valuation of taxable property, the two (2) mill tax levy on each dollar of assessed valuations equals a rate of taxation of twenty cents (\$0.20) on each one hundred dollar of assessed valuation of taxable property,

SECTION 4: This Resolution shall take effect immediately.

RESOLVED AND ENACTED this 21<sup>st</sup> day of December, A.D., 2016.

**TOWNSHIP OF SEWICKLEY**

---

**Joseph Kerber - Chairman**

---

**Brian Merdian - Vice-Chairman**

---

**Alan Fossi - Supervisor**

**ATTEST:**

---

Secretary-Treasurer

Date: \_\_\_\_\_

**2017 Crabapple Pool Prices  
Season Passes**

<b>Membership Type</b>	<b>Sewickley Township Resident</b>	<b>Non-Resident</b>
(1) Individual	<b>\$80</b>	<b>\$85</b>
(2) Individual	<b>\$145</b>	<b>\$150</b>
(3) Individual	<b>\$190</b>	<b>\$195</b>
(4) Individual	<b>\$235</b>	<b>\$240</b>
(5) Individual	<b>\$270</b>	<b>\$275</b>
(6) Individual	<b>\$295</b>	<b>\$300</b>
(7) Individual	<b>\$340</b>	<b>\$350</b>
(8) Individual	<b>\$385</b>	<b>\$400</b>
Senior (65+)	<b>\$50</b>	<b>\$60</b>
Senior Couple (65+)	<b>\$80</b>	<b>\$90</b>
10-day Admissions	<b>\$65</b>	<b>\$65</b>
5 Admissions	<b>\$35</b>	<b>\$35</b>

**Daily Admission Rates – 2017**

<b>General Admission (3 years old to adult)</b>	<b>\$8.00</b>
<b>2 and under</b>	<b>FREE</b>
<b>Senior Citizens (65+)</b>	<b>\$3.50</b>
<b>After 5:00 pm</b>	<b>\$3.50</b>
<b>After 5:00 pm Seniors (65+)</b>	<b>\$2.50</b>
<b>Groups of 10 or more (must be pre-registered as a group)</b>	<b>\$6.50</b>
<b>Wednesday Evening Swim (7:30 pm – 10:00 pm)</b>	<b>Pass Holders FREE</b> <b>Non-Pass Holders/General Admission \$3.00</b>

## Crabapple Pool Splash Party 2017

# of Swimmers	Lifeguards Needed	Rate
1-75 Swimmers	(3 lifeguards)	<b>\$235</b>
76-125 Swimmers	(4 lifeguards)	<b>\$295</b>
126-175 Swimmers	(5 lifeguards)	<b>\$355</b>
176-225 Swimmers	(6 lifeguards)	<b>\$425</b>

### DAYTIME PARTY INFORMATION 2017

- Party reservation times are either **12:00 - 3:00** or **3:30 - 6:30**.
- A \$40.00 deposit is required at the time of your reservation.
- There is a \$30.00 pavilion rental fee and \$5.00 "PER GUEST" party rate charge. (Children 3 and under are Free).

**THESE RATES INCLUDE ALL SWIMMERS AND NON-SWIMMERS**

### CRABAPPLE PAVILION RATES 2017

Pavilion (12 tables, water, electric)	Resident	Non-Resident
Friday, Saturday, Sunday, Holidays	\$ 125.00	\$ 150.00
Friday Evening (5pm)	\$ 75.00	\$ 100.00
Monday-Thursday	\$ 40.00	\$ 55.00

Time Extensions are available until **10:00 pm** for an **additional \$25.00**.

### CRABAPPLE POOL SWIM LESSON RATES 2017

- Resident \$60.00/per child
- Resident Sibling \$50.00
  
- Non-Resident \$65.00/per child
- Non-Resident Sibling \$55.00