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Chairperson Wanda Layman on Wednesday, March 21, 2012 at 7:00pm at the Sewickley Township
Municipal Building, called the Regular Monthly Meeting of the Sewickley Township Board of Supervisors
to order as advertised in The Times-Sun on Thursday, January 12, 2012. The members of the Board of
Supervisors present were Wanda Layman, Joe Kerber, and Alan Fossi. Also attending the meeting were
Marianne Errett, Matthew Fine, Sharon Cerne, Alan Samulski, Kathy Kerber, Micki Patterson, Jack
McWilliams, Ann McWilliams, Paul Rupnik, Jr., Tim Luft, Paul Rupnik, Sr., Tom Lord, Steve Solomon,
Lewis Stout, Jay DiPerna, Amber Kline, Stacey Federoff, Jonathan Jobe, Janet Schork, Dean
Zimmerman, Paula Alcott, and Susan Leukhardt.

Mrs. Layman led those present in the Pledge of Allegiance.
Mrs. Layman swore in Matt Fine as Fire Police.
Report from Road Master, Joe Kerber
We met with the Township Engineer and the Conservation District regarding Volk Road. We need
approximately 100 foot of pipe for the job and we are asking Chevron is they would like to work in
conjunction with us since they are putting a drive way in for a well. The crew pulled ditches on part of
Oggs Lane, Volk Road, and Highberger Road and Shaner Road. Tree brushing has taken place on
Taylor, Ted, Lash, Beacon Light, Highberger, and Derr Roads. The grader transmission is now done.
We are working on the paver and truck #10.
Roads to be paved with Liquid Fuel money are Firehall Lane and Rillton-Guffey Road. Township money
will be used for around the maintenance shed in the back to bring up to DEP specs. Turnback money will
be used for Highberger, Beacon Light, Derr, and Apples Mill Roads. Two of the roads may be put on hold
if gas wells are going in. With CDBG money, the roads to be paved as long as the money is there is Main
Street Alley, Library Alley, Second Street, Sixth Street, Seventh Street, Eighth Street, Highland, Madison,
Dexter, and Clopper.
Report from Recreation Director, Janet Schork
We are still waiting for the baseball schedule from Bob Lavella. He will have it to her by April 1 st. Once
we have it, then we can offer the available time out for renters. We will be starting to work at Crabapple
Pool assessing if it will need painted this year among other things. We might be getting a reprieve on the
chair lift due to it being a hardship for small communities. We have a dance scheduled at the Recreation
st
Center on March 31 . The last one was a success with over 130 children and made approximately $500.
th
The public time rules are working and going very well. The Easter Egg Hunt is on Saturday, April 7 at
noon. The donations from local businesses for the Egg Hunt are incredible. Lastly, the website is
completed.
Report from Ordinance Officer, Dean Zimmerman
Since last month, he has continued to work on various violations in the Herminie, Rillton, and Hutchinson
areas as well as spotty violations in other parts of the Township. Some of those have been, and will be,
ongoing as he works with the property owners in attempting to bring the properties into compliance. He
has begun the junkyard inspections and two (2) have been completed and has three (3) to go.
We recently received some bad news from the Redevelopment Authority of Westmoreland County. Due
to a reduction in Federal funding, the Authority has made a policy change that involves matching monies
for their demolition program. All properties that we currently have applications on file with the
Redevelopment Authority, and all future applicants, will be required to pay $3,000.00 per demolition in
matching monies. Those monies need to be paid by the property owner, the Township, or a combination
of both. We are all still working on how the Township will handle this issue.
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He now has eight cases in District Court awaiting disposition. Two are scheduled for Summary Trial on
Thursday, March 29th. One case still has an active arrest warrant outstanding. The other five are waiting
to be scheduled for trials unless those folks plead guilty or do not respond to Judge Christner’s summons.
If they don’t respond to the summons, arrest warrants will be issued for them also.
As the temperatures have begun to rise recently, so have the number of complaints. He reminds
everyone that grass and other vegetation is not allowed to be any higher than twelve inches unless you
are zoned A-1, Agricultural. Additionally, if you are going to burn your yard waste that has accumulated
over the winter or any other legal materials over the course of the summer, please burn on Wednesdays
and Saturdays between 6:00am and 6:00pm. If you do that, he won’t have to come out and pay you a
visit.
Micki Patterson asked if Mr. Zimmerman noticed the property across the street from Crabapple Park. Mr.
Zimmerman has sent a letter notifying them of the ordinance violations.
An Executive Session was held tonight at 6:30pm to discuss equipment and personnel issues.

Mrs. Layman thanked Kathy Kerber for donating the new Township Sign!
Public Comment
Alan Samulski was called to speak about the Sewage Authority. Mrs. Layman stated first that the MSATS
is completely separate from the Supervisors. The only authority the Board of Supervisors have is to
appoint the Board. The current MSATS Board has been in place before their time.
Alan Samulski read the following statement:
“You, the elected members of the Sewickley Township Board of Supervisors, were elected in good faith
and trust by the voting residents of the Township. You were elected as trustees of the common good and
in the best interest of the community at large. With the appointment and subsequent denial of any
responsibility for the miscreant actions and operations of the MSATS Board, you have sadly failed
miserably in your tasked mission to care for and protect the interests and well-being of the electorate.
Our faith and last hope resides in you.
The MSATS Board has not only neglected, but refused, to attend to the real needs and concerns of the
“real” people throughout the community. They, themselves, have stated that they answer to no one.
You, who are only three, have deigned to appoint a total of nine members to MSATS (the largest sewage
board in all the surrounding areas). By far, if three can run the whole Township, why does it take nine to
handle the feces? This is clearly top heavy and unwieldy government. Especially when you, yourselves,
claim that although you maintain the power and the ability to appoint them, you do not have the power to
remove, control them, or their actions singularly or in total. They could not exist nor have been appointed
legally under the laws of the Commonwealth of PA and sundry Federal Statutes unless you made and
created Township Ordinance in order to do so. We realize that your predecessors bear the brunt of this
weight, but it’s all you now.
You, the current electees, are obviously failing your bosses, the residents who elected you. And you are
claiming there is nothing you can do.
Apparently MSATS now controls you just as you are controlling the citizens by the skillfully manipulated
power of fear. And it all comes down to the dollar in the final analysis now doesn’t it. The citizens can’t
appeal to you for redress because you deny any accountability and cry that your hands are tied. Well, the
Supervisors handed them the rope or did they tie themselves and each other up?
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The residents are afraid of interest on their bills (which are arbitrary and capricious fabrications
perpetrated by MSATS to cover their individual and collective butts), to have their water shut off and liens
placed on their properties if they don’t pay. What kind best interest of the electorate is that?
You are personally subject to the same regulations. They control you because you are afraid that if the
Supervisors take control or assume the functions of MSATS, then you, the Township Board, will end up
assuming responsibility for their financial fiasco, and in order to cover it, you might as well have to raise
taxes (relative or not to the debt in question) and/or not get re-elected. That happened around here
before with the school tax debacle. We all, the citizens, do acknowledge, understand, and appreciate
that. But if you can establish an Ordinance allowing and permitting you to create MSATS and appoint
members to it, then it stands to reason, common sense, and stature-based legality that you can create
and establish an Ordinance or Ordinances allowing you to replace members of that board. Stand up.
Take the responsibility for the common good of the voting public and just do it.
If you already possess the power, then we urge and implore you to use it. Please indulge me (standing
for the people of Sewickley Township and speaking to the common good and welfare of the residents of
the community) to put forth these analogies. This is how you are currently being viewed by the
community at large… that you are shirking your responsibility and duty to them and side-stepping your
tasked mission (by virtue of election) to look out for them. It has been researched and established that as
the only responsible elected officials in this district, you can be replaced and voted out of office, mid-term,
through legal proceedings. Which many people in the community have suggested and are prepared to
do. Some of us don’t feel that this would be judicious, but rather you should take immediate steps as a
governing body to address and remediate the situation at hand by whatever means available and
necessary.
You understandably feel that you are between a rock and a hard place. If you do not already have
Ordinances in place to remove members of the MSATS Board, it simply demonstrates a serious short
sightedness of you part. We all know how hard taking responsibility for someone else can be, but you
were elected to perform the hard tasks as well as the easy ones. Find us some solutions.
The MSATS is your child, or to reference Mary Shelly’s “Frankenstein”, your monster. Your child, like
anyone else’s, is currently a juvenile. And you, as parents, are clearly by law, responsible for their
actions. It’s time for some disciplinary action. If a local juvenile runs amuck in the community robbing,
stealing, mugging, and destroying people’s property, they and their parents are held accountable and the
parents are responsible to stop the child and make restitution or force the child to make restitution.
MSATS does not, as they claim, have a 20 million dollar debt. After grants, they have approximately 12
million. It does not have to be paid this week. When questioned on their current, short term financial
picture, they evade the question and recite numbers like the total cost of the project.
Let me take the parent/child analogy a step further. We, the electorate, are your creators and parents.
You are the parents/creators of MSATS. So, I guess that makes us grandparents. We will not and
should not have to raise your children, but we should and will tell you they are out of line and suggest that
you take appropriate action to rein them in. So, as your aging, loving parents, we have entrusted you as
Power of Attorney and caregivers for our lives and properties. Apparently, you have assigned that task to
our grandchild. Well, your child totally neglects and rejects all that we say and do claiming that they have
sole power to run their own lives. They are robbing us and seizing our property as well as seriously,
negatively in real terms endangering the health and lives of some of us. Would you really let your child
(monster) do that to your own real live parents. We certainly hope not.
Our lives and wallets are truly in your hands where we chose to put them and absolutely not in the hands
of your brat whom you claim that you can’t, or more precisely, won’t control.
Mrs. Layman stated that MSATS is over 12 million dollars in debt. If the Township would assume their
debt, you, the taxpayers, would assume their debt. We have looked at it at all angles. We are frustrated.
We are trying to do what’s best for the residents. Is that to takeover the Authority? We are not sure at
this point.
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Mr. Kerber stated that when one someone is appointed to a Board, the only change of removing them is if
they resign or when their term is up. About the finances, if we were to take over MSATS and would have
to borrow money, it would go against the Township’s borrowing power. If we had a catastrophe, we
would be putting ourselves bankrupt.
Mr. Fossi stated that he understands that it has been frustrating for the residents. It has been frustrating
for the Supervisors. He was involved with the Sewage Authority for ten years. He was the first Chairman
in 1997 when the Township chartered the Board so he has some limited knowledge but things have
changed now. Don’t think that we have no power or authority to do something. Mr. Kerber is absolutely
right in saying that we can not change board members. There is a solution, but we don’t want to go there.
We could dissolve the Board, but we don’t want to go there.
Mrs. Layman wants him to understand that we can not change what has already happened. We can not
change the payments. We are not taking this lightly. We have spent a lot of time with this.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to disburse 2010 EMS Tax funds on behalf of the
Lowber Volunteer Fire Co. as follows:
Fortunato’s Service –

pump repair on Engine 16-1
service on Engine 16-2

$

Fortunato’s Service -

repack pump on Engine 16-1
replace 2 bad gauges

$ 1,043.98

Susquehanna Fire Equip –

CO detector repair

$ 230.00
$ 2,059.81

785.83

Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to disburse the 2011 EMS Tax Money equally
between 6 entities being Herminie, Lowber, Rillton, and Hutchinson Fire Companies, Emergency
Management, and Sewickley Ambulance Service. The total 2011 EMS Tax collected was $88,161.10.
Each entity will receive $14,693.52. The funds will be kept in the EMS Tax Account until invoices /
purchase orders are submitted and approved by the Board of Supervisors. Board Comments: Mrs.
Layman stated that if a payment is to be made to a bank, it is to be paid directly to the bank. Voting: Mrs.
Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to ratify the Participation Agreement with DGS
Costars for the purchase of salt for the 2012-2013 season. Estimated tonnage for the 2012-2013
purchase shall now be 1,000 ton. We will be required to purchase a minimum of 60% to a maximum of
140% of the estimated tonnage. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried
unanimously.
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Proposals for approximately 3,500 ton of Type 2 anti-skid materials were opened, read aloud, and
recorded on Wednesday, March 14, 2012 at 10:00am as follows:
Ligonier Stone & Lime Company
d/b/a Derry Stone & Lime Company
FOB Plant
FOB Jobsite
3,500 ton

Type 2 Anti-Skid Material

$ 12.40

$ 22.75

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the proposal for approximately 3,500 ton of
Type 2 Anti Skid to Ligonier Stone & Lime Company at the above prices. The contract shall be effective
April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried
unanimously.
Proposals for per unit pre-cast basin (Penn Dot type) 2’ x 4’ x 3’; pre-cast basin (Penn Dot type) 2’ x 4’ x
2’; pre-cast basin (Penn Dot type) 2’ x 2’ x 2’; Type “M” inlet top with bicycle grate 2’ x 4’ x 8”; Type “M”
inlet top with bicycle grate 2’ x 4’ x 6”; Type “M” inlet top with bicycle grate 2’ x 2’ x 8”; and various inlet
risers were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Wednesday, March 14, 2012 at 10:00am as follows:

Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2’ x 4’ x 3’
Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2’ x 4’ x 2’
Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2’ x 2’ x 2’
Type “M” Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2’ x 4’ x 8”
Type “M” Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2’ x 4’ x 6”
Type “M” Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2’ x 2’ x 8”
2’ x 4’ x 2” Inlet Riser
2’ x 4’ x 4” Inlet Riser
2’ x 4’ x 1” Inlet Riser
2’ x 4’ x 6” Inlet Riser
2’ x 4’ x 8” Inlet Riser
2’ x 4’ x 12” Inlet Riser

Culverts, Inc.

Pleasant Unity Supply

FOB Plant
Per Unit
$ 246
$ 203
$ 155
$ 406
$ 406
$ 212
No Bid
$ 57
No Bid
$ 57
No Bid
$ 85

FOB Plant
Per Unit
$ 253
$ 214
$ 169
$ 365
No bid
$ 164
No Bid
$ 53
No Bid
$ 49
$ 106
$ 72

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the following items to Culverts, Inc.: PreCast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2’ x 4’ x 3’; Pre-Cast Basin (Penn Dot Type) 2’ x 4’ x 2’; Pre-Cast Basin
(Penn Dot Type) 2’ x 2’ x 2’; and Type “M” Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2’ x 4’ x 6”. The contract shall be
effective April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion
carried unanimously.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the following items to Pleasant Unity
Supply: Type “M” Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2’ x 4’ x 8”; Type “M” Inlet Top with Bicycle Grate 2’ x 2’ x
8”; 2’ x 4’ x 4” Inlet Riser; 2’ x 4’ x 6” Inlet Riser; 2’ x 4’ x 8” Inlet Riser; and 2’ x 4’ x 12” Inlet Riser. The
contract shall be effective April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi;
yes. Motion carried unanimously.
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Proposals for approximately 100 feet of 10 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections; 200 feet of 12
inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections; 600 feet of 24 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot
sections; 100 feet of 36 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections; 600 feet of 4 inch Schedule 40
plastic pipe, 10 foot sections; 200 feet of 6 inch Schedule 40 plastic pipe, 10 foot sections; 30 each of 4
inch Fernco plastic to plastic; 30 each of 4 inch Fernco clay to plastic; and 120 feet of 60 inch smooth
bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Wednesday, March 14,
2012 at 10:00am as follows:
Culverts, Inc.

100 feet
200 feet
600 feet
100 feet
600 feet
200 Feet
30 each
30 each
120 feet

10 inch smooth bore plastic pipe,
20 foot sections
12 inch smooth bore plastic pipe,
20 foot sections
24 inch smooth bore plastic pipe,
20 foot sections
36 inch smooth bore plastic pipe,
20 foot sections
4 inch Schedule 40 plastic pipe,
10 foot sections
6 inch Schedule 40 plastic pipe,
10 foot sections
4 inch Fernco plastic to plastic
4 inch Fernco clay to plastic
60 inch smooth bore plastic pipe,
20 foot sections
Must be PennDot Approved

Per Foot/each
$ 3.50

Pleasant Unity
Supply
Per Foot/each
$ 3.50

Chemung
Supply
Per Foot/each
$ 3.50

$ 4.04

$ 4.04

$ 4.04

$ 13.05

$ 13.05

$ 13.05

$ 23.30

$ 23.30

$ 27.40

$ 1.97

$ 2.16

$ 1.60

$ 4.36

$ 3.99

$ 3.57

$ 3.75
$ 3.75
$ 79.00

$ 3.74
$ 3.74
$ 79.00

$ 3.95
$ 3.95
$ 79.00

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Joe Kerber, to award the following items to Chemung Supply at
the above prices: 100 feet of 10 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections; 200 feet of 12 inch
smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections; 600 feet of 24 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections;
and 120 feet of 60 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections. The contract shall be effective April
26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried
unanimously.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the following item to Pleasant Unity Supply
at the above price: 100 feet of 36 inch smooth bore plastic pipe, 20 foot sections. The contract shall be
effective April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion
carried unanimously.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the following items to Pleasant Unity
Supply: 30 each of 4 inch Fernco plastic to plastic and 30 each of 4 inch Fernco clay to plastic. The
contract shall be effective April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi;
yes. Motion carried unanimously.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the following items to Chemung Supply:
600 feet of 4 inch Schedule 40 plastic pipe, 10 foot sections and 200 feet of 6 inch Schedule 40 plastic
pipe, 10 foot sections. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs.
Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.
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Proposals for approximately 2,500 ton of 2A; 1,000 ton of 2RC; 500 ton of #8 Aggregate; 800 ton of #3
Aggregate; 500 ton of #1 Aggregate; 500 ton of Gabion Stone; 2,500 ton of #57 Limestone; 2,500 ton of
#67 Limestone; 500 ton of R-4; and 500 ton of #4 Aggregate were opened, read aloud, and recorded on
Wednesday, March 14, 2012 at 10:00am as follows:

2,500 ton
1,000 ton
500 ton
800 ton
500 ton
500 ton
2,500 ton
2,500 ton
500 ton
500 ton

2A
2RC
#8 Aggregate
#3 Aggregate
#1 Aggregate
Gabion Stone
#57 Limestone
#67 Limestone
R4
#4 Aggregate

FOB
Plant
$ 7.50
$ 7.50
$ 19.10
$ 8.75
$ 5.60
$ 10.10
$ 9.50
$ 10.25
$ 10.10
$ 9.55

Amerikohl Mining
FOB
Delivered As
Jobsite
Directed
$ 15.50
$ 15.00
$ 15.50
$ 15.00
$ 27.10
$ 26.60
$ 16.75
$ 16.25
$ 13.60
$ 13.10
$ 18.10
$ 17.60
$ 17.50
$ 17.00
$ 18.25
$ 17.75
$ 18.90
$ 18.61
$ 17.55
$ 17.05

Hanson Aggregates
FOB Jobsite
$ 14.98
$ 14.98
$ 25.48
$ 16.48
$ 14.48
$ 18.98
$ 16.98
$ 17.98
$ 18.98
$ 16.48

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the following items to Amerikohl Mining:
500 ton of #1 Aggregate; 500 ton of Gabion Stone; and 500 ton of R4 at the above prices. The contract
shall be effective April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes.
Motion carried unanimously.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the following items to Hanson Aggregates:
2,500 ton of 2A; 1,000 ton of 2RC; 500 ton of #8 Aggregate; 800 ton of #3 Aggregate; 2,500 ton of #57
Limestone; 2,500 ton of #67 Limestone; and 500 ton of #4 Aggregate at the above prices. The contract
shall be effective April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes.
Motion carried unanimously.
Proposals for approximately 5,000 gallon of AE – T (Tack Oil); 50,000 gallon CRS-2PM; and 4,000 gallon
E-1 Prime were opened, read aloud, and recorded on Wednesday, March 14, 2012 at 10:00am as
follows:

5,000 gallon
5,000 gallon
50,000 gallon
4,000 gallon

AE – T (Tack Oil)
Delivered
AE – T (Tack Oil)
Applied to Road
CRS-2PM
E-1 Prime

Russell Standard
Corp.
Delivered As
Directed
$ 1.280

Suit-Kote Corp.

$ 5.942

$ 1.288

$ 2.566
$ 1.911

$ 2.564
$ 1.925

Delivered As
Directed
$ .150

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the following items to Suit-Kote Corp.:
5,000 gallon AE – T (Tack Oil) delivered and to apply to the roads and 50,000 gallon CRS-2PM at the
above prices. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr.
Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the following item to Russell Standard
Corp.: 4,000 gallon E-1 Prime at the above price. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2012 to April
25, 2013. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.
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Proposals for approximately 6,000 ton of Superpave Asphalt 9.5 mm, PG 64-22, 0 to 0.3 million ESAL’s
SRL-G; 6,000 ton of Superpave Asphalt 9.5 mm, PG 64-22, 0.3 to 3 million ESAL’s SRL- G; 6,000 ton of
Superpave Asphalt 19.0 mm, PG 64-22, 0 to 0.3 million ESAL’s SRL-G; and 6,000 ton of Superpave
Asphalt 19.0 mm, PG 64-22, 0.3 to 3 million ESAL’s SRL-G were opened, read aloud, and recorded on
Wednesday, March 14, 2012 at 10:00am as follows:

6,000 ton
6,000 ton
6,000 ton
6,000 ton

Hanson Aggregates
FOB Plant
$ 56.50 / ton

Superpave Asphalt 9.5 mm, PG 64-22
0 to 0.3 million ESAL's SRL-G
Superpave Asphalt 9.5 mm, PG 64-22
0.3 to 3 million ESAL's SRL-G
Superpave Asphalt 19.0 mm, PG 64-22
0 to 0.3 million ESAL's SRL-G
Superpave Asphalt 19.0 mm, PG 64-22
0.3 to 3 million ESAL's SRL-G

$ 56.50 / ton
$ 50.50 / ton
$ 50.50 / ton

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the Superpave Contract to Hanson
Aggregates at the above prices. The contract shall be effective April 26, 2012 to April 25, 2013. Board
Comments: Mr. Kerber stated that the price for base coat only went up $.50 per ton and $1.50 per ton for
top coat. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to purchase Bituminous Stockpile Patching material
(cold mix) through Hei-Way, LLC which is also through the COSTARS Program. Voting: Mrs. Layman,
Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals were opened, read aloud and recorded on Wednesday, March 14, 2012 at 11:00am for
“Township Mowing”; the cutting and trimming of the following locations when the height of the grass
reaches four inches. The Contractor shall be responsible for labor, fuel, materials, equipment costs and
Workers Compensation and Liability Insurance. The contract shall be effective March 22, 2012.
“TOWNSHIP MOWING”
Includes the following locations

Township Building lawn
Recreation Center lawn
Recreation Center bank facing Pike
Street
The former Herminie Reservoir
Guffey Cemetery
Quaker Cemetery
Shaner Honor Roll
The Project 70 property located behind
Rillton Fire Company
Keystone Playground
Old Mars Hill Cemetery (Reservoir Rd,
Herminie)
Lowber Playground

Faust
Landscaping
and Lawn
Care
$ 495.00

Mikes Lawn
Care

Ricky Welch

$ 420.00

$ 390.00

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the “Township Mowing” contract for the
locations listed above to Ricky Welch. This includes the cutting and trimming of those locations when the
height of the grass reaches four inches. The Contractor shall be responsible for labor, fuel, materials,
equipment costs and Workers Compensation and Liability Insurance. The contract shall be effective
March 22, 2012. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.
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Proposals were opened, read aloud and recorded on Wednesday, March 14, 2012 at 11:00am for
“Crabapple Mowing”; the cutting and trimming of the following locations when the height of the grass
reaches three inches. The Contractor shall be responsible for labor, fuel, materials, equipment costs and
Workers Compensation and Liability Insurance. The contract shall be effective March 22, 2012.
“CRABAPPLE MOWING”
Includes the following locations

John C. Bruno Memorial Football Field
All baseball and softball fields
Crabapple Park

Faust
Landscaping
and Lawn
Care
$ 600.00

Mikes
Lawn
Care

Loren
Fox

Ricky
Welch

$ 600.00

$ 580.00

$ 850.00

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to award the “Crabapple Mowing” contract for the
locations listed above to Loren Fox. This includes the cutting and trimming of those locations when the
height of the grass reaches three inches. The Contractor shall be responsible for labor, fuel, materials,
equipment costs and Workers Compensation and Liability Insurance. The contract shall be effective
March 22, 2012. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Proposals were received for the purchase of a 2000 or newer street sweeper truck. They are as follows:

YEAR
MAKE
MODEL
MILEAGE
HOURS
ENGINE

A&H
Equipment

US Municipal
Supply

US Municipal
Supply

$ 35,000.00
2000
Elgin
Crosswind J
48,030
3,158
John Deere
4045T

$ 159,000.00
2009
Global
M3

$ 42,000.00
2004
Johnston
4000
5,737
5,966

John Deere
4045T 115 HP

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, for Township Mechanics to inspect the years 2000
and 2004 sweepers before determining the purchase of said sweeper. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber,
Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

A petition from Angelcyk Holdings, LLC has been received by the Board of Supervisors to vacate a
portion of Angelcyk Lane, T-364, as it traverses the property from Taylor Road on the northerly edge to
Apples Mill Road on the southerly edge.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to authorize Dan Hewitt to prepare an ordinance to
vacate a portion of Angelcyk Lane and schedule a hearing. Legal fees will be paid by Angelcyk Holdings,
LLC. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to approve Requisition No. 67 received on March
14, 2012 from MSATS in the amount of $226,573.41. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes.
Motion carried unanimously.
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A letter has been received from Lee-Anna Talarico regarding her quarterly invoice from Veolia Solid
Waste of PA, Inc. Ms. Talarico is requesting that the Township Supervisors waive her garbage service
and all bills relating to garbage pickup through Veolia due to using her business’s Veolia dumpster.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to waive Lee-Anna Talarico resident garbage
service and all bills relating to garbage pickup through Veolia Solid Waste of PA, Inc. due to using her
business’s Veolia dumpster pending verifying their business and location. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr.
Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to authorize Lisa Maskowitz, Zoning Chairperson, to
attend the “Zoning Decisions” Seminar on March 29, 2012. This is being held at Doubletree by Hilton in
Monroeville from 6:00pm to 9:30pm. The cost is $50.00. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi;
yes. Motion carried unanimously.
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to authorize the Sewickley Township Recreation
Board use of the large pavilion at Crabapple Park on Saturday, May 5, 2012 from 11:00am to 1:00pm for
their annual Rabies Clinic. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried
unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to establish the 2012 daily and seasonal admission
rates for Crabapple Pool. Please see attached. Board Comments: Mrs. Layman stated that the rates
remained the same except for a reduction in the 10-day pass. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr.
Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to advertise for summer employment at Crabapple
Pool. Positions include facility management, lifeguards, and concession. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr.
Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Alan Fossi made a motion, seconded by Joe Kerber, to set the rates for the following positions for the
2012 season at Crabapple Pool.
Pool Manager
Head Lifeguard
Senior Lifeguard
Second Year Guard
First Year Guard
Concession / Gate

$9.00
$8.25
$7.75
$7.50
$7.35
$7.35

Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.
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Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to approve the following bills for payment.
General Fund:

Check 23983 - $ 874.53 (2/15/12)
Checks 4377 to 4404 - $ 36,570.26 (2/23/12)
Checks 4405 to 4415 - $ 27,560.93 (3/8/12)
Check 23984 - $ 183.95 (3/8/12)
Checks 4416 to 4451 - $ 17,040.28 (3/15/12)

Crabapple:

Check 3810 - $ 32.35 (2/23/12)
Check 3811 - $ 48.23 (3/8/12)
Checks 3812 to 3813 - $ 114.35 (3/15/12)

Payroll Invoices:

Checks 2475 to 2477 - $ 2,099.30 (2/23/12)
Draft 90117 - $ 592.73 (2/23/12)
Draft 90118 - $ 496.06 (2/23/12)
Check 2481 - $ 163.00 (3/8/12)
Checks 2487 to 2488 - $ 425.28 (3/15/12)
Draft 90119 - $ 503.96 (3/19/12)

Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.

Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to approve the following payrolls for payment.
Employees Payroll:

2/24/12 - $ 8,748.85 – check 2474 , drafts 22561 to 22572
3/2/12 - $ 8,184.82 – check 2478 , drafts 22573 to 22584
3/9/12 - $ 9,590.75 – checks 2479 to 2480 , drafts 22585 to 22597
3/16/12 - $ 11,081.93 – checks 2482 to 2486 , drafts 22598 to 22610
3/23/12 - $ 10,101.58 – check 2489 , drafts 22611 to 22623

Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.
New / Old Business
Joe Kerber made a motion, seconded by Alan Fossi, to change the meeting date in April to April 11, 2012
at 7:00pm. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Motion carried unanimously.
Supervisor Alan Fossi attended the Westmoreland Conservation District Roundtable on Friday, February
10, 2012 from 7:30am to 11:00am.
Susan Leukhardt announced that she is accepting donations to the Muscular Dystrophy Association. She
is being “locked up” on April 18th.
Alan Fossi announced that Earth Day is on April 21st. We are asking for volunteers to help clean up
Crabapple Park.
With no further business to come before the Board, Joe Kerber made a motion to adjourn, seconded by
Alan Fossi. Voting: Mrs. Layman, Mr. Kerber, Mr. Fossi; yes. Meeting adjourned at 7:59pm.

Susan D. Leukhardt
Secretary-Treasurer

2012 CRABAPPLE POOL

Season Passes
Membership
Type
Family (2 adults + 3 children)
Each Additional Child for
family pass (max of 8 per
pass)
Parent-Child
Individual
Senior (65+)
Senior Couple (65+)
10-Day Pass

Early Bird
Resident Rate
(ends May 31)*
$ 200
$ 20

Early Bird NonResident Rate
(ends May 31)
$ 225
$ 25

Resident
Rate (begins
June 1)
$ 225
$ 25

Non-Resident
(begins June 1)

$ 125
$ 65
$ 40
$ 65
$ 35

$ 140
$ 80
$ 55
$ 80
$ 40

$ 135
$ 75
$ 50
$ 75
$ 50

$ 160
$ 90
$ 65
$ 90
$ 55

Daily Rates
General Admission (4 years old to adult)
3 and under
Non-Swimming Chaperone
Senior Citizens (65+)
After 5:00 pm
After 5:00 pm Seniors (65+)
Groups of 10 or more (must be pre-registered as group)

$ 6.00
FREE
FREE
$ 3.00
$ 3.00
$ 2.00
$ 4.00

$ 240
$ 30

